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PRICE & SONS
Gene Price • Larned, KS • 620-285-3189

www.priceandsonsconstruction.com
Jesus is Lord

Family Owned and Operated For Over 30 Years
100% Local

100% American
100% Doing Business With Us
Keeps Your Money Local

Bathroom Remodel

Kitchen Updates

Additions and New Construction

GUY’S LIQUOR, LLC
620-285-6321

Guy and His Crew
‘Please don’t drink and drive!’

619 Topeka St. 
Larned, KS

“We’re here to 
help you plan 
your next 

backyard barbecue!”

Lisa Sparke, Owner
201 Colony Ave., Kinsley, Ks. 67547

620-659-3346
Mixed Bedding Plants

Large Selection of
Flowering and Vegetable Plants
Grown in Our Greenhouse

Since 1962
Colony Floral & Greenhouse

519 Broadway
Larned, KS

620-285-6543

∙Clothing
∙Woodwick 

Candles
∙Jewelry
∙Purses

∙Scarves
∙Home Decor
∙Gormet Food
∙Dips & Mixes

∙Candy

Country 
Seasons

“More than 
Just a Flower 

Shoppe!”

www.countryseasonsflowers.com
Like us on Facebook

	 After a few months 
of chilly temperatures, 
come spring, many 
homeowners are eager 
to throw open their 
windows and doors and 
breathe new life into 
their homes. Simple 
changes made now - 
even before the weather 
begins to warm up - can 
improve interior spaces 
and brighten the atmo-
sphere of a home.
	 · Go plant shopping. 
Research from NASA 
suggests adding at least 
one plant in your home 
per 100 square feet is 
efficient enough to clean 
air. Fresh foliage also 
makes a home feel warm 
and inviting. Water-
ing and misting plants 
introduces moisture into 
indoor air, which can 
make rooms overcome 
with dry air from heat-
ing systems feel com-
fortable. Just be sure 
to avoid overwatering 
plants, which can lead to 
mold growth.
	 · Swap out throw 
pillows. Accent pillows 
on beds and sofas are 
quick and inexpensive 
ways to add new bursts 
of color to rooms. You 
may be able to make 
over a room’s entire 
color scheme with new 
pillows. Invest in pil-
lows that you can switch 
with each season so your 
decor will never look 
tired or dull.
	 · Clean existing light 
fixtures. Another way 
to brighten the mood 
in a home is to periodi-
cally clean light fixtures 
to make sure they are 
working effectively. 
Spend time dusting them 
and cleaning off any 
accumulated debris. If 
need be, switch out old 
lamp shades for newer 
ones that let more light 
shine through. If inad-
equate lighting is a prob-
lem no matter how many 
lamps you have, consult 
with an electrician about 
installing more overhead 
and accent lighting.
	 · Give rugs and floors 
a deep cleaning. Recir-
culated air may be full 
of dust and other micro-
scopic particles that end 
up blowing throughout 
your home. Also, it’s 
easy to track in dirt 
and other materials on 
your shoes that become 
imbedded in carpeting. 
At least once a year, rent 
or enlist the surfaces of 
carpet and upholstery 
cleaners to give floors a 
thorough cleaning. You 
may be surprised at how 
clean and fresh a home 
looks and smells once 

rugs and carpets are 
deep-cleaned. You also 
can make a dry carpet 
cleaner using baking 
soda, corn starch and 
desired fresh herbs for 
fragrance. Sprinkle and 
then vacuum up after a 
few hours.
	 · Color-coordinate 
bookshelves. Group all 
books with similarly 
colored covers together 
for an instant and eye-
appealing look.
	 · Simmer some home-
made home deodorizer. 
In a large pot, boil water 
and some scented herbs, 
such as rosemary, citrus 
rinds, vanilla, or laven-
der. The aroma will waft 
through the home, creat-
ing a pleasing scent.
	 · Invest in new win-
dow treatments. Light-
weight draperies or 
new blinds or shades 
can transform the look 
of a room. Be sure to 
keep curtains and blinds 
open during the day to 
maximize the hours of 
sunlight.
	 Homeowners can 
make some simple 
changes while they’re 
stuck indoors and reap 
the benefits when the 
weather warms up again. 

Fresh flowers, new throw pillows and lightweight 
draperies are some easy ways to transform a home 
in time for spring’s arrival.

Freshen up your home for the spring season


