
the Chorus for one year. 
She received the Ameri-
can History Award from 
the Woodmen of the World 
Life Insurance Society; has 
been an active Girl Scout 
for 13 years, helping with 
community service projects 
such as picking up litter for 
the Weakley County Litter 
Grant program and building 
and planting flower gardens 
at Unimin’s Natural Grass 
Habitat in Gleason, now 
known as Gleason Clay; vol-
unteered at Lake Nowhere; 
and played on the fall soccer 
league for six years. She is 
an active member at St. Jude 
Catholic Church in Martin 
where she was a Teen in 
Ministry for her Dioceses, 
helping lead her youth group. 
She has attended three work 
camps with her youth group 
to do various service work in 
the urban areas of Atlanta, 
Toledo and Philadelphia. 
She graduated with Honors 
and is a Tennessee Scholar.

She plans to attend the 

University of Tennessee at 
Martin and major in Pre-Vet.

No. 6 – Alexander Brent 
Montgomery is the son of 
Brent and Michelle Mont-
gomery. During his four 
years at Dresden High 
School, he was an active 
member in Beta and Skills 
USA, serving as President 
of Skills USA his senior 
year. He shoots trap with the 
Weakley County Top Guns 
4-H team, where he has been 
on the varsity squad the past 
three years and is currently 
squad leader. He drag races 
and has been driving a junior 
dragster since he was 8 years 
old. He is also an avid hunter 
and fisherman. He is an ac-

tive member at Union Cha-
pel Church of Christ and is 
involved in community ac-
tivities including Relay for 
Life Weakley County, vol-
unteering at Red Fern Ani-
mal Shelter and assisting the 
Palmersville Volunteer Fire 
Department with selling fire-
works and mowing the de-
partment’s yard. He received 
a provost scholarship and the 
Walter Blackburn Memorial 
Alumni scholarship. He is a 
Tennessee Scholar and grad-
uated with honors

He plans to attend Murray 
State University and major 
in Chemistry. 

No. 7 – Catherine Baker 
is the daughter of Paul and 

Deanna Higgs of Dresden 
and Brian Baker of Ocean 
Springs, Miss. She partici-
pated in numerous school 
and community activities as 
well as played soccer for the 
last several years for the City 
of Dresden Soccer League. 
She was named Outstand-
ing Student in Anatomy and 
Physiology. She was a four 
year member of the Beta and 
HOSA clubs and attended 
the American Legion Aux-
iliary Girls State her junior 
year. She is a member of 
Oak Grove Baptist Church 
in Dresden where she serves 
as church secretary as well 
as participating youth group 
mission trips. She graduated 

with honors and is a Ten-
nessee Scholar. She plans to 
attend Jackson State Com-
munity College and pursue a 
childhood vision of a career 
in Radiography.

No. 8 – Lauren Trout 
is the daughter of Kenny 
and Valerie Troutt. She is 
a four-year member of the 
FFA chapter, serving as 
the chapter’s reporter and 
secretary and received the 
Greenhand, Chapter and 
State degrees. She has been 
active in Mu Alpha Theta, 
Beth, Weakley County 4-H 
and the Weakley County 4-
H Mounted Drill Team. She 
was also involved with the 
DHS livestock program. She 

graduated with distinction 
and is a Tennessee Scholars 
student. She plans to attend 
the University of Tennessee 
at Martin, majoring in Vet-
erinary Science followed by 
the University of Tennessee 
at Knoxville to finish her ca-
reer path. 

No. 9 – Kristin Gallimore 
is the daughter of David and 
Tonia Gallimore of Dres-
den. During her four years 
at Dresden High School, She 
was involved in a variety of 
school activities and clubs, 
including four years in FC-
CLA and the Beta club. Dur-
ing her senior year, she re-
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AAuto Repair
“Honest

Repairs at 
Honest Prices”

731-587-6001
Mon-Fri 8am-5pm • Sat 8am-12pm

Air Conditioning 
Coolant Flush 

Exhaust
Engine Performance 

Tune Ups 
Shocks & Struts

Brakes 

Trailer Hitches 
Welding 

Suspension 
Transmissions
Fuel Injection 

(Maintenance & Repair)
Wheel Alignment

Tires (Sales & Service)

UTM Discount

+
200 Tom Smith Rd., MartinCongratulations

Graduates!

Alex SleddKristin GallimoreLauren TroutChatherine BakerAlexander Brent Montgomery
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