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KNOXVILLE (AP) — John 
Ward, the radio voice of 
Tennessee football and 
men's basketball for over 
three decades, has died. He 
was 88.

Vol Network tweeted 
that Ward died Wednesday 
night in Knoxville. Tennes-
see athletic officials con-
firmed Ward's death.

Ward became Tennes-
see's radio play-by-play 
voice for men's basketball 
in 1965 and started filling 
the same role for football 
three years later. He retired 
after the 1998-99 school 
year.

He started every game 
by saying "It's Football 
Time In Tennessee" and 

would say "Give Him Six" 
after Tennessee touch-
downs.

Ward was named Ten-
nessee sportscaster of the 
year 28 times.

Tributes to Ward were 
prominent on social media 
Wednesday night.

U.S. Sen. Lamar Alex-
ander, R-Tenn., said via 
Twitter that Ward "was a 
generous, courteous, en-
thusiastic ambassador" for 
the University of Tennes-
see.

"When it came to UT 
sports, listening to John 
Ward was almost as good 
as watching the game," Al-
exander tweeted. "In fact, 
many Vol fans at many 

games brought their radios 
to make sure they could do 
both."

Southeastern Conference 
commissioner Greg Sankey 
tweeted that Ward's "voice 
helped shape the history of 
this great conference."

"Legendary John Ward 
has been called home to 
be God's legendary play-
by-play announcer," for-
mer Tennessee and NFL 
defensive lineman Albert 
Haynesworth tweeted .

The fourth level of the 
Neyland Stadium press 
box was named the John 
Ward Broadcast Center in 
1995. Ward was inducted 
into the Tennessee Sports 
Hall of Fame in 1991.

Former voice of the Vols dies

LAS VEGAS (AP) -  
Electronic Arts Inc. 
unveiled the first look at 
EA SPORTS NHL 19 to 
hockey fans at the 2018 
NHL Awards presented 
by Hulu in Las Vegas. 
Electronic Arts also 
revealed Nashville 
Predators’ Norris Trophy-
winning defenseman and 
Olympic gold-medalist, 
P.K. Subban, as the NHL® 
19 cover athlete. 

“Growing up, and still 
to this day, my friends 
and I love seeing who is 
on the cover and ulti-
mately getting to play the 
game,” said Subban. 

“Being the cover athlete 
for NHL 19, for me, rep-
resents growth within 
our sport, embracing dif-
ferent personalities, and 
showing that anything is 
possible. I’m honored to 
be able to sport the 
Smashville colors on this 
year’s cover.” 

RINNE RECOGNIZED 
AS TOP GOALIE 

Nashville goaltender 
Pekka Rinne won the 
Vezina Award, given 
annually to the top goal-
tender, Wednesday at the 
NHL  Awards in Las 

Vegas. 
Rinne, 35, edged out 

Connor Hellebuyck of 
the Winnipeg Jets and 
Tampa Bay Lightning 
goalie Andrei Vasilevskiy.

Rinne, who finished 
second twice and third 
once before winning, fin-
ished the season third in 
wins (42), tied for the 
NHL lead with eight 
shutouts and helped the 
Predators claim the 
President's Trophy as the 
league's top regular-sea-
son team.

Voting was completed 
after the end of the regu-
lar season.

Subban graces NHL '19 cover

Coming out of his shell

Jeffery Simmons photo
Panter Nursery catcher Turtle Laxson comes out to field a throw from his 

teammate during Tuesday's T-ball action at Jim Mansfield Field.

Dr Pepper
Continued from page 1B

Other Saturday games 
include Tuscalooss and 
Tullahoma playing at 10 
a.m. and Columbia and 
Tullahoma taking the 
field at 3 p.m.

The Post 173 15U team 
has had a strong run in 
the last two week, sweep-
ing Shelbyville last week 
before splitting a pair 
with Tullahoma Monday. 
Chance Hunter had the 
walk-off hit in an 8-7 
extra-inning victory at 
home Monday.

Jeffery Simmons photo
Will Vance looks for a chance to score during Tues-

day's 15U Post 173 game. The 15U team will be in 
action this weekend in the Dr Pepper Invitational.
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