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Mississippi College graduates Chris 
Thurman and his wife, Kim, need no 
introduction to the Clinton campus. A 
1993 MC graduate, Chris played on 
the Choctaws hoops team, while Kim 
starred on the Lady Choctaws squad 
at the A.E. Wood Coliseum.

Now their son, Tanner, age eighteen, 
is the latest to join the Thurman fami-
ly tradition at the Christian university. 
The Brookhaven Academy graduate 
seeks a spot on the MC basketball ros-
ter under coach Mike Jones.

A shooting guard and point guard, 
Tanner Thurman was among 140 
freshmen visiting Mississippi College 
recently for the summer’s second ori-
entation. 

“It was mostly his decision, al-
though he’s obviously real familiar 
with the school,” Chris Thurman said. 
“The School of Business was very at-
tractive to him. That was a big factor 
in his decision.”

A member of the MC Sports Hall of 
Fame, Kim Thurman notes her alma 
mater sits close to home in Brookha-
ven. The Lincoln County community 
is located ninety minutes from Clin-
ton. That was another selling point for 
their son, a future business major.

Summer orientation allows fresh-
men to register, make new friends, get 

acquainted with professors and learn 
about campus organizations.

MC begins its 194th academic year 
in late August. 

Freshman Mattie Floyd of Brookha-
ven wanted to attend Mississippi 
College because of its Christian en-
vironment. The close-knit college at-
mosphere, said the West Lincoln High 

graduate, enables her to build a closer 
relationship with professors. The bio-
chemistry major seeks to go to med-
ical school. MC offers outstanding 
programs to make that happen, Floyd 
says.

“I liked the vibe and the energy,” 
said freshman Takaye Farmer of 
Memphis. “Everybody at MC is really 

welcoming.”
Sports attracted Trellis Williams, 

eighteen, of Byram. Trellis played 
basketball for the “Victors,” a squad 
of home-schooled players from metro 
Jackson communities. Now, he hopes 
to win a spot on the blue and gold’s 
hoops roster.

Playing football at Starkville High 
opened doors for Keith “KJ” Law-
rence to join the Choctaws team in the 
Gulf South Conference. Their 2019 
season opens with a September 7 road 
game against the Alcorn State Braves. 
The freshman will hit the books as a 
kinesiology major.

Most students attending orienta-
tion came from Mississippi and oth-
er Southeastern states. One family 
selected MC after recently relocating 
thousands of miles to the U.S. Two 
weeks ago, Jerry Brown retired from 
the U.S. Navy in Japan and moved 
to Pensacola, Florida. A Florida pas-
tor encouraged the Brown family’s 
daughter to consider MC, and she en-
rolls this fall. 

Math professor John Travis is de-
lighted his youngest daughter, Laura 
Joy, eighteen, will soon join the Class 
of 2023 at his alma mater. A 2019 
Clinton High graduate, Laura Joy Tra-
vis will be a math major when class-
es start in late August. John and Ruth 
Travis are the parents of two other 
daughters with MC diplomas.
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Members of the Class of 2023 have their first lunch at the Mississippi College 
cafeteria during summer orientation. 


