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Snoball week was held January 14th through the 18th. There were 

a lot of dressing up and activities that took place during the week.  
Monday’s dress up day was Tacky Tourist Day, and the activity was 
Basketball. All grades were welcome to come and watch. Tuesday’s 
dress up day was Spirit Day, and the activity was a Pep Fest. All 
students came to show their tiger spirit. Many games were held, 
such as a hula hoop activity for all the grades. 

Sophomore Colby Larson said, “The games were fun to watch and 
everyone looked like they were having a good time.” Wednesday’s 
dress up day was Superhero/ Super Villain Day, and the activity was 
a Scavenger Hunt that grades 7th-12th participated in. Juniors and 
Seniors won the scavenger hunt. Thursday’s dress up day was Senior 
Citizen day, and the activity was watching the Junior High Play. 

Sophomore Grace Lider said “It was very good, and worth going 
to.”  Friday we ended the week with our “Dress-Up” dress up day, 
were all the elementary students took their class pictures.  

The week finished off with the 2019 Snoball Coronation. The 
candidates for the senior girls were Rachel Brendon, Cora Honer, 
and Rylee Rieken. The senior boys were Jacob Christ, Nick 
Kusnierek, and Cole Weets. Junior class royalty were Hannah Fisher 
and Isaac Fredrickson. Sophomore royalty were Lily Wheelwright 
and Tresten Peterson. Freshman royalty were Abby Honer and Gage 
Johanson. Scarlett Sullivan and Anthony Montanari were the 1st 
grade attendants. Cora Honer was crowned Snoball Queen and Cole 
Weets was crowned Snowball King. Congratulations to both of them. 
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