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The Carol Martin Gat-
ton Academy of Math-
ematics and Science in 
Kentucky is a residen-
tial program for bright, 
highly motivated 
Kentucky high school 
students who have 
demonstrated interest 
in pursuing advanced 
careers in science, 
technology, engineer-
ing, and mathematics. 
As according to www.

wku.com in the Gat-
ton Academy Section. 
Housed on the campus 
of Western Kentucky 
University, students 
take college classes, 
engage in faculty-led 
research, and have the 
ability to study abroad.  

Each year, The Gatton 
Academy admits ap-
proximately 95 Ken-
tucky sophomores, 
half of selection male 
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During the COVID-19 
Pandemic, technology 
is something we should 
all be thankful for. For 
some, things such as 
Facetime is the only 
way to communicate 
with loved ones while 
social distancing is im-
plemented. Another 
reason to be thankful 
for technology is that 
doctors can provide 
telehealth - or as some 
practices call it Dr. On 
Call - to their patients 

without meeting face-
to-face.

Telehealth allows care 
for patients to be pre-
sented to them in a 
new way that is safe 
and convenient. The 
patient can connect 
to a provider from the 
comfort of their home 
using a computer, tab-
let, or smart phone 
through a video con-
ference. 

According to the Cum-
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The 2020 Kentucky 
Derby will be the 146th 
Kentucky Derby. The 
Kentucky Derby is reg-
ularly scheduled to be 
held the first Saturday 

in May. However, due 
to the COVID-19 Pan-
demic in the United 
States, the 2020 run-
ning has been resched-
uled to Saturday, Sep-
tember 5th, 2020. Cheyenne Popplewell

The Times Journal

Last week Governor 
Andy Beshear dis-
cussed the details on 
re-opening the state 
of Kentucky. This will 
not be a fast-paced 
process, as Kentucki-
ans have already seen. 
However, Governor 
Beshear wants to re-
open while continuing 
the steps already put 
in place to keep Ken-
tuckians safe from 
COVID-19.

According to WBKO, 
Governor Beshear an-
nounced new regu-
lations and goals for 
the “Healthy at Work” 
initiative. One regu-
lation will be that all 
Kentuckians will have 
to wear a mask in pub-
lic by May 11. Beshear 
said people who do not 
follow the guidelines 
will not be cited, but 
they will be asked to 
put on masks. Another 
part of the new regula-
tion is that it is man-
datory for businesses. 
Businesses not mask-
ing could be grounds 
for temporary closure. 

A post was made on 
Facebook asking oth-
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