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*HCCSD Delivering
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following state-mandated 
safety protocols, are train-
ing school leaders and teach-
ers to provide online virtual 
learning activities, assign-
ments and assessments to 
students at home during 
this social isolation period. 
Chief of School Leadership, 
Dr. Joann Rucker, said, “We 
are working with our educa-
tional partners Renaissance 
(Math and Reading) and 
Edgenuity (online curricu-
lum and learning solutions) 
in addition to others, to give 
all of our students the means 
to continue and complete the 
requirements for this aca-
demic year.”

Additionally, Title funds 
were reallocated to purchase 
one-to-one computing devic-
es for all students in the dis-
trict so that their educational 

gains won’t slide during their 
time away from school. 

“We will also provide hot-
spot devices or create mobile 
internet access locations for 
all homes at no cost to our 
families,” Henderson said.

The district is survey-
ing parents to identify areas 
without internet access. “Our 
students and staff will benefit 
from the changes to our stan-
dard way of doing things as 
we learn more ways to com-
municate, solve problems 
and learn during this new 
normal,” Henderson said. 
“We are going to be better 
for overcoming this cata-
strophic pandemic.”

Henderson went on to say, 
“We want every student in 
this district to have equal ac-
cess to maintain the progress 
of their educational trajec-
tory. Families were contact-
ed regarding the process for 

procuring the devices and 
received information on how 
to access the online virtual 
learning sites. Building lead-
ers are applauding the efforts 
of the district.

HCCHS assistant princi-
pal Antwayn Patrick said, 
“though we are dealing with 
a very challenging situation, 
I applaud Dr. Henderson’s 
efforts to modernize our 
district. Providing comput-
ing devices and hotspots 
removes the barrier to on-
line learning that rural areas 
have.” 

Zenobia Cockrell, a librar-
ian at William Dean Elemen-
tary School, agrees. “Provid-
ing computers is a plus since 
so many students do not have 
them at home. The district’s 
website is also beneficial 
because it is a one-stop site 
that provides updated infor-
mation and communication, 
designed to keep everyone 

informed.”
With a growth mindset and 

determination to improve, 
easing the financial burden 
and hardships of families 
in the HCCSD is one of 
Dr. Henderson’s top priori-
ties. The district began meal 
deliveries March 17 and 
will continue for as long as 
schools remain closed. The 
number of meals distributed 
has steadily increased and 
this is good news for the dis-
trict. “We want our families 
to stay healthy,” Henderson 
said. “Delivering meals dur-
ing this time of insecurity 
will help relieve some of the 
scarcity our families are ex-
periencing.” 

Holmes County Central 
High School (HCCHS) stu-
dent Harvey Ellington is 
grateful for this service. “I 
appreciate the district for 
doing this because it means 
a lot to my family and other 

members in our community.”
Dr. Shem Whigham, as-

sistant principal of HCCHS 
said, “People are excited to 
see the efforts of the district, 
going the extra mile, espe-
cially considering the chal-
lenges of doing it in a rural 
district.”

Congressman Bennie G. 
Thompson (MS-02) said, 
“I am proud of the Hol-
mes County Consolidated 
School District for their 
leadership and service. They 
are serving their community 
by delivering meals directly 
to students and families, of-
fering school counselor as-
sistance, and distributing 
computing devices and hot 
spots to provide internet 
access to all families in the 
district. These services are 
increasingly important to 
provide our community with 
a sense of normalcy during 
these uncertain times. We 

are all appreciative of ev-
erything the District is do-
ing to help the community.”

Lexington Mayor Robin 
McCrory said “I have the 
utmost gratitude to the com-
munity, school district fac-
ulty and staff for stepping up 
and being responsive to the 
federal and state guidelines 
to maintain social distance 
and minimize contact. I’m in 
full support of the grab-n-go 
meals and the online learn-
ing the district is providing.”

“During these challeng-
ing times, we are stronger 
together. We will continue 
to communicate with our 
community and keep our 
families updated,” Hender-
son said. “Our website and 
social media accounts will 
always have the most current 
information pertaining to our 
schools and the district’s op-
eration; this is our commit-
ment to you.”

March 26 - Terrell 
Hammett, Whitman Sanders, 
Louis Ferrell, Valerie 
Hollins, Nat Hooker, Lydia 
Williamson, Courtney 
Steverson, Causey Johnson, 
J. B. McBride

March 27 - Chandler Woo, 
Mike Steen, Halley Box

March 28 - Roxann 
Malone, Glen Lawson, 
Landry Gardner, Wyn Diggs, 
Debby C. Meeks, Carolyn 
Love, Cortez Epps, Sasha 
Harrell, LaShunkeita Clark

March 29 - David 

McBride, Antonio Bailey, 
Marvin O’Reilly, Kilpatrick 
Sims, Maggie Garrett, Kalen 
Joe, Dakota Webster, Cindy 
Gnemi Woody, Janet Martin, 
Jessie Williams, Mason 
Ables, Neal Frazier, Chanel 
Burns

March 30 - Victor Gilbert, 
Debbie McLemore, Lance 
White, Cha’mylah Miller, 
Chanta Grayson, Carrie 
Dillon

March 31 - Bro. Jack 
Wooten, Sara H. Roberts, 
Jim Harrell, Cartrina Benson, 
Bubba Spell, Jr., Sandra 
Jenkins, Tissie Brock, Agnes 
Williams

April 1 - Christin Smith 
Downs, Liz C. Taylor, Rufus 
Waddell, Jr., Mary Grace 
Allen, Haleigh Hutchison, 
Iva Beth Lindsey, Ella Mae 
Boykin
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monitor the elections calen-
dar and consult with health 
officials as he looks at other 
upcoming elections in Mis-
sissippi while prioritizing the 
protection of public health.


