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www.GreenacresGreenMarket.com
For more info (561) 642-2090

Social Distancing
Observed

Pets are Welcome

Free Parking

Food, Jewelry
Gifts and more

632 Lake Ave
Lake Worth, FL 

33460

HOURS:
SUN - THUR 

11 AM - 12 MIDNIGHT
FRI & SAT 
11 AM - 2 AM

www.daveslastresort.com

HAPPY HOUR * 7 DAYS A WEEK 2-7 PM

A Drinking Establishment...

With A Great Food Problem!
HAPPY HOUR 2 - 7 PM • 7 DAYS

Wing Platters to GoWing Platters to Go

$911

99
Chicken 

Wings

NFL PlayoffNFL Playoff

Lake Worth’s One 
& Only Raw Bar
OVER 9 MILLION 

OYSTERS SERVED

Football Specials
During all NFL Playoff Games (Saturday & Sunday)

and NCAA Championship Game (Monday) 

FREE BEERduring all New England Patriot Playoff Games(offer expires 3-1-2020)

$327
Select

Domestic
Bottles

Manning the Kettle
On December 12, Chap-

ter EZ of the PEO Sister-
hood manned the Salvation 
Army Red Kettle at Publix 
on Military Trail and Mela-
leuca from 10 a.m. to 8 p.m. 
Kara Jo Stevens, Pat Alfele 
and daughter Karen, June 
Sadler, Ann Growney, Pat 
Simon, Janet Lisle and Char 
Macon took shifts. They all 
found it to be a rewarding 
experience and would like to 

volunteer next year. Their 
individual encounters will 
be shared at the next meet-
ing. The Salvation Army 
has been the philanthropic 
project for Chapter EZ for 
15 years.

“Our Red Kettles sup-
port local year round pro-
grams and services. Having 
volunteers who are passion-
ate about our mission at 
the Red Kettles during the 
Christmas Season is one of 

our greatest joys,” stated 
Lt. Crystal Porter.

 The Salvation Army 
of Lake Worth helps year 
round with emergency food, 
hygiene kits, rent and utili-
ties assistance, vouchers for 
clothing and furniture as 
well as youth programs and 
recreation. By volunteering 
to ring the bell, Chapter EZ 
raised over $1,500 for The 
Salvation Army’s mission in 
the Lake Worth area.


