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sophomore with a .298 bat-
ting average through 57 plate 
appearances. She appears set 
for a larger role this season 
and is off to a good start. She 
missed a few games due to 
participating in the county’s 
Distinguished Young 
Woman program, but has hit 
at a .667 clip through three 
games and driven in three 
runs, while also scoring three 
times.  
Meadows had a strong jun-

ior campaign with a .472 bat-
ting average. The Pearl River 
Community College signee 
hits for power and average 
and accounted for 24 runs 
last year. So far as a senior, 
she is batting .400 with five 
runs scored and three RBIs. 
Jordan and Knight led all 

returning starters a year ago 
with nine extra-base hits, 
including one home run. 
Jordan finished her sopho-
more campaign with 11 
RBIs and 16 runs scored. 
Through three games this 
year, she is among the team 
leaders in on-base percent-
age. Knight with 17 runs 
scored last year and is hit-
ting at a .455 clip so far this 
season. 
Keys played in 10 games 

last year, but did not have a 
varsity at-bat. But, the 
sophomors has been hot out 
of the gates so far this sea-
son. Stats through three 
games show her tied for the 
top batting average (.667) 
and leading the team in 

slugging percentage (.833) 
with five runs scored and 
three driven in. 
Erin Meadows was among 

the team leaders in plate 
appearances as an eighth 
grader, and took advantage of 
the opportunity by posting a 
.429 batting average. 
Meadows is expected to be a 
major contributor this year 
and gives Barham the luxury 
of having a solid hitter with 
good speed propping up the 
back end of the lineup. 
Making an early impact in 

her first campaign with the 
Lady Cats is Tungett, who is 
carrying a .500 average at the 
plate and reached base 60 
percent of the time thus far.
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GCHS junior Breeze Jordan (Above-R) is shown talking with 

senior CharLee Meadows in between innings of a recent 
game. Meadows and Jordan, who hold down the 3-4 slots in 
the regular Lady Wildcats’ hitting order, are two of the top 
returning hitters on a squad that packs a solid punch.

Seventh grader Addie 
Tungett is shown talking 
with GCHS assistant coach 
Chasity Jordan after       
reaching base in a game  
earlier this year. The Lady 
Wildcats have found a lot of 
talent in the county’s junior 
high schools in recent years 
and this year is no different. 
Tungett is expected to not 
only make a difference at 
the plate and on the bases 
for the Lady Cats, but also in 
the pitching circle. 
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