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NWS “Weather Ready 
Nation Ambassador of 
Excellence Award.”

Brian Schoettmer, 
a Meteorologist with 
the National Weather 
Service in Louisville, 
said Wilson received 
the award because the 
NWS wished to “give 
Daniel the recognition 
he deserves.”

Schoettmer said 
Wilson “was chosen out 
of over 150-plus ambas-
sadors in our region for 
the work he is doing in 
helping to make resi-
dents in the area more 
weather ready.”

Wilson now stands 
with such entities as 
AccuWeather - another 
recipient of the NWS 
“Weather Ready Nation 
(WRN) Ambassador of 
Excellence Award.”

For the sixth year, 
NOAA and the National 
Weather Service 
have honored a se-
lect number of WRN 
Ambassador organiza-
tions who have made 
significant contribu-
tions to building a 
Weather-Ready Nation. 

By serving as change 
agents and leaders 
in their communi-
ties, Ambassadors of 
Excellence have:

• Inspired others to 
take action and become 
ready, responsive, and 
resilient

• Created innova-
tive ways to engage 
their community, their 
workforce, and/or their 
social network

• Formed unique col-
laborations with NOAA 
and/or other ambas-
sador organizations to 
achieve goals they alone 
could not meet

• Embraced build-
ing “a Weather-Ready 
Nation for All” by 
addressing vulnerable 
populations’ needs.

“The Storm Alert 
Center in Russell 
County has quickly 
become an Ambassador 

of Excellence in and 
around the Lake 
Cumberland region of 
Kentucky,” Schoettmer 
said. 

Schoettmer and 
Mike Kochasic, 
Warning Coordination 
Meteorologist with the 
NWS in Louisville, 
travelled to Russell 
Springs to visit Wilson’s 
Storm Alert Center, and 
present him with the 
award.

During a Facebook 
Live broadcast of the 
ceremony, Koshasic 
and Schoettmer praised 
Wilson not only for 
his weather work, but 
also his philanthropic 
efforts.

Wilson spearheaded 
efforts to raise over 
$10,000 for a single 
mother in western 
Kentucky who lost her 
home to a tornado-then 
a fire, and most recent-
ly helped gather over 
$11,000 for an eastern 
Kentucky family whose 
home was washed away 
by a catastrophic flood.

“The Storm Alert 
Center is more than a 
weather center,” Wilson 
said. “We (Wilson and 
Storm Anchor Keith 
Richardson) work hard 
to bring severe weather 
coverage. We have 
our on-site, live storm 
tracking system as well 
as radar.”

The Storm Alert 
Center has been been 
considered a true 
trendsetter. 

“After the storm, we 
go to where the damage 
is,” Wilson said. “We 
report to our followers 
as well as the National 
Weather Service. Since 
I began this business, 
we have responded to 
hurricane disasters 
with aid and supplies. 
When the generational 
tornadoes came thru 
western Kentucky and 
the floods ravaged 
eastern Kentucky, we 
were there making a 
difference.”

Wilson and the Storm 

Alert Center team is 
appreciative “to the 
30,000 people who 
like or follow us on 
Facebook.”

“But for those who 
may not do social me-
dia, we can be found at 
stormalertcenter. com,” 
he said. “When the big 
storms roll in, we want 
people to be prepared 
and proactive because 
the next disaster may 
see us standing in 
need.”

The Storm Alert 
Center’s setup, ser-
vice and outreach was 
praised by the NWS.

“A term we use in 
the weather service 
is ‘force multiplier,’ 
” Schoettmer said. 
“The fact you are get-
ting message out to 
that many people…
that’s amazing. You’re 
expanding the mes-
sage and getting it out 
there.”

“That’s kind of 
the whole sphere of 
the Weather-Ready 
Nation,” Kochasic said. 
“At the weather service 
in Louisville, we’re only 
about 20 folks. We can 
talk about safety, and 
preaching where people 
should go during severe 
weather as much as 
we can. We need folks 
like Daniel...to help out 
by spreading the word 
when severe weather 
strikes. And it will.”

“Your setup you have 
here is very impres-
sive,” he said. “I think 
it’s a model to follow. 
Anybody interested in 
weather…or anybody 
who has a weather 
interest in their local 
community, Daniel 
would be the guy to talk 
to.”

“Most of it came 
piece-by-piece,” Wilson 
humbly said. “It’s fell 
together when it was 
supposed to.”

“Thanks for the con-
fidence over the years,” 
he said. “We truly ap-
preciate it.”

“We sure were glad 
she was able to make 
the trip!” Bradshaw 
said. 

Along with enjoying 
food and fellowship, 
participants also took 
care of some “official 
business” by electing 
new leaders.

Martina Hopper 

Haydon was elected 
president, JoAnn 
Ooten, vice-president, 
and Lyda Hopper 
Foster chosen as trea-
surer for 2023.

The next reunion is 
scheduled for Saturday, 
October 7, 2023, at 
the Salem Elementary 
Cafeteria.

The gathering is 
meaningful to the for-
mer classmates.

“It’s been a great 
pleasure to be a part of 
this wonderful group 
through the years,” 
Bradshaw said. “I hope 
we can continue hav-
ing these reunions for 
many years to come.”

“There’s people 
over there who are 
still without a place to 
live,” he said, “and we 
started making plans 
to at least be able to 
give them a hot meal 
during the holidays.”

So, with a lot prayer, 
and hopefully some 
donations, Young will 
head east next month 
with a goal to feed even 
more people.

“Happy Hawg 
BBQ - with the help 
of Justin Burris, and 
other people in Russell 
and Adair Counties 
- will be going back 
to Jackson, KY with 
another free meal for 
the flood victims on 
December 3,” Young 
said.

“We’re hoping to feed 
2,500 this time,” he 
said.

Young admits it’s an 
ambitious project, but 

“the Lord provides.”

At presstime, “105 
gallons of green 
beans, 104 gallons of 
corn…enough mashed 
potatos to feed 2,500 
people...enough gravy 
for 2,500 meals…2,500 
bottles of water” have 
been secured for the 
trip.

“The ladies at the 
Church Of God, in 
Jackson (Where Young 
will set up), are going 
to make enough ba-
nana pudding to feed 
2,500 people,” Young 
said. 

But there are addi-
tional needs…

“We only have 15 
turkeys and hams,” he 
said. “We will need 85 
more. We’re going with 
pre-cooked…because 
it would take so much 
time to prepare other-
wise. I’m gonna throw 
them on my smoker, 

though…to give them 
that good taste.”

During this giving 
season, Young said he 
is thankful for support 
already received, and 
for future assistance.

“I’ve had like, $200 
given so far and Justin 
had $400 given from 
his Sunday School 
class that he used to 
buy items,” he said.

In the midst of the 
holiday, “pre-cooked 
turkeys are hard to 
find right now at a rea-
sonable price,” Young 
said. 

Donations can be 
left at the Happy Hawg 
BBQ (at the intersec-
tion of U.S. 127 and KY. 
80) or Justin Burris 
can be contacted at 
(270) 250 3528.

“It’s truly going to be 
a blessing to help those 
in need,” Young said.

 By MARY BETH SALLEE
Jobe Publishing Reporter
marybeth@jpinews.com

It’s that time of year 
again, folks. The time 
of year for the great 
debate: when is the 
appropriate time to 
begin decorating for 
Christmas?

It’s a classic case of 
Team Turkey versus 
Team Tinsel. One side 
says if you decorate 
early, you’re forget-
ting to be thank-
ful. The other side 
says that decorating 
early means enjoying 
Christmas longer.

To decorate early or 
not to decorate early, 
that is the question.

Christmas is my 
favorite holiday. I love 
the tree lights being 

the only glow in the 
room, and I also love 
the spirit of giving 
to others. But I was, 
at one time, one of 
those that couldn’t 
believe people would 
have Christmas 
decorations up before 
Thanksgiving. I mean, 
who does that?

 But flash forward a 
few years and a child 
later, and I totally get 
it. The holidays often 
seem rushed already, 
and time goes by so 
fast. Why not enjoy it 
a bit longer? Why not 
enjoy Christmas lights 
while eating turkey?

So, I did it…or at 
least on a small scale. 
I bought another 
Christmas tree, and 
I let my boy put it up 
this past Wednesday 

in my home office. 
I fixed the tree and 
put on the lights, and 
then I brought out the 
ornaments of his and 
let him decorate as he 
pleased. To say he was 
ecstatic would be an 
understatement, and 
to see him happy to 
decorate a tree now 
made my heart happy 
also.

To sum it all up, 
whether you’re Team 
Turkey or Team Tinsel, 
you do you. Enjoy 
what makes you happy 
in whichever holiday 
spirit you choose.

Mary Beth Sallee 
resides in Hart County 
with her husband 
and son. She works 
as a reporter for Jobe 
Publishing.
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