
She has been a member 
of the Pine Fork Youth 
Group since she was 11. 
She is a Health Science 
completer. She played vol-
leyball from 7th grade till 
her Sophomore year. Her 
future plans are to earn an 
associates in business at 
Wilkes Community Col-
lege and then continue 
to work in the veterinary 
field. 

KADEN MILLER is 
the son of Kim and Kerry 
Miller. He is CPR certi-
fied, BQA certified, won 
all conference in tennis 
during his Junior year, and 
won the Math 2 award. He 
has been involved in ten-
nis for all 4 years of high 
school. He was on the 
cheer squad for his Se-
nior year. He plans on at-
tending Pitt Community 
College to take the basic 
courses in order to have 
a better chance of getting 
into Forsyth Tech’s medi-
cal sonography program. 
Once completed, he will 
become a certified ultra-
sound tech.

HEIDY M. MON-
TALVO COLÓN is the 
daughter of Daisy Colón 
and Hector Montalvo. She 
has been awarded as Cum 
Laude and NC Scholar. 
She has been involved in 
the National Art Honors 
Society. She plans to be-
come a mortician and one 
day open her own funeral 
home. 

PHOEBE MURPHY 
is the daughter of Derrick 
and Susanne Murphy. She 
has been on the Princi-
pals list the past 4 years 
and was also awarded the 
Scholar Athlete award 
her Junior year. She has 
been on the varsity vol-
leyball, basketball, and 
track teams for all 4 years 
of high school. She is also 
a member of Beta Club, 
Mental Health Club,  and 
is Student Council Presi-
dent. She plans to enter 
NC State’s Exploratory 
Studies program this fall. 

ATLANTA MURRAY 
is the daughter of James 
Murray and Wendy Hud-
son. During her time at 
AHS, she participated in 
FFA and was awarded the 
Microsoft Certification, 

WorkKeys Bronze Certi-
fication, and CTE Com-
pleter. She has also been 
employed at Glade Creek 
Animal Hospital. She 
plans to pursue a career as 
a phlebotomist and work 
in the medical field.

CECILIO PEREZ is 
the son of Amanda and 
Cecilio Perez-Flores. He 
was a member of the soc-
cer and cross-country 
team. His future plans are 
to work with his dad in 
construction. 

 
JULIO PEREZ is the 

son of Fabiola Perez. He 
placed 3rd at SkillsUSA 
and is 1G certified. He 
plans on obtaining his di-
ploma for welding at Wil-
kes Community College

MEMPHIS PEROS 
is the son of Angela and 

Tony Peros. He plans to 
work and possibly attend 
trade school.

CHANCE PRES-
TON is the son of Tricia 
and Eric Preston. He has 
played basketball all four 
years, and he has been part 
of the Beta Club. After 
school, he plans to attend 
Wilkes Community Col-
lege to further his educa-
tion in welding. He also 
plans on working at Pio-
neer Eclipse, or anything 
else to continue my weld-
ing career. 

FAITH PRESTON 
is the daughter of Tricia 
and Eric Preston. She has 
earned her certification in 
first aid and is CPR certi-
fied. She achieved Silver 
level for the ACT. She 
placed second place in 
the Soil and Water poster 

competition in 9th grade. 
She worked on the year-
book committee during 
her Senior year. She was 
part of the Lady Trojans 
volleyball team for all four 
years. Her future plans are 
to attend Surry Communi-
ty College to complete the 
cosmetology program and 

eventually own her own 
salon.

PATIENCE PRES-
TON is the daughter of 
Tricia and Eric Preston. 
She has received a plati-
num on the Workkeys 
test. She is certified in 
Adobe Photoshop, Adobe 

Illustrator, and Adobe 
Premiere Pro. She was an 
Honor Marshal (top 10) 
during her Junior year, and 
is in the top 20 during her 
Senior year. She partici-
pated in swimming, is in 
the Technology Student 
Association, High School 
Battle of the Books, and 
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Congratulations 2023 Gradua
tes

Loans for land, farms and homesLoans for land, farms and homes
Farm CreditFarm Credit

CongratulationsCongratulations
Alexis Scott and Gracie Barker

and the Class of 2023!
WWee’’rree  aallll  pprroouudd  ooff  yyoouu!!
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Way to go, Graduates!

Faith taMara PrestON PatieNce JeMM PrestON Jessie BreaNNe WiNkler PricechaNce DakOta PrestON

Circle L Family Restaurant
3238 U.S. Hwy. 21 S.,
Glade Valley, NC
336-372-5555

Graduating Seniors
receive $1.00 discount

on your meal—
Must bring in coupon. 

Circle L
Family Restaurant

would like to congratulate the

Graduating Class of 2023
and wish you theand wish you the

Best of Luck On Your Journey!Best of Luck On Your Journey!

aNtONiO cesar raMirez
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23


